

RFP Pricing Tabulation - Continued on next slide

Description of Items Promotional/Printing Solutions		Respondents					
		Elite Promotions	Tumbry Printing & Office Supplies, Inc.	Copy Craft Printers, Inc. dba Slate Group	AHI Enterprises, LLC	Jan Hall Promotions	World of Promotions
		Brownsville, TX	Houston, TX	Lubbock, TX	San Antonio, TX	Brownsville, TX	Elk Grove Village, IL
1	Polo Shirts Nike Size S-XL	\$35.77	\$45.99	\$33.98	\$26.85	\$32.00	\$29.00
2	Polo Shirts Ash City S-XL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.60	\$14.50	\$20.00
3	Shirts Fruit of the Loom S-XL	No Bid	\$4.04	\$4.26	\$5.20	\$3.40	\$3.50
4	Caps	\$7.98	\$6.28	\$6.38	\$6.35	\$7.16	\$5.95
5	Umbrella w/single tone	\$9.25	No Bid	\$12.38	\$11.55	\$7.74	\$6.99
6	Backpack	\$2.19	\$2.64	\$0.80	\$2.20	\$1.53	\$1.69
7	Plastic bags	\$1.20	No Bid	\$2.29	\$0.70	\$0.39	\$0.50
8	Adhesive phone wallets	\$1.20	\$1.54	\$0.89	\$0.86	\$0.44	\$0.75
9	Orange lanyard	\$2.18	No Bid	\$1.44	\$1.17	\$1.22	\$0.70
10	Pens	\$0.37	\$0.43	\$0.35	\$0.29	\$0.25	\$0.30
	Average Price Promotional Item	6.01	6.09	6.28	6.78	6.86	6.94
11	Banner 3x8 vinyl	\$96.00	\$119.00	\$141.97	\$95.00	No Bid	\$125.00
12	Posters 24x36, one sided	\$11.80	\$28.29	\$12.58	\$18.81	No Bid	\$0.05
13	Brochure 8.5x11	\$1.39	\$1.29	\$1.36	\$0.95	No Bid	\$0.40
	Average Price Printing Solutions	36.40	16.12	16.82	14.04	No Bid	14.99
	Score	17.82	6.68	19.46	15.78	21.03	15.91

Note: The order of appearance is from lowest to highest respondent based on averaged price for some of the most common purchased items.



RFP Pricing Tabulation- Final slide

Description of Items Promotional/Printing Solutions		Respondents						
		Automed Land Inc., dba VecoPress	4imprint, Inc.	Club Colors Buyer, LLC	Fiesta Graphics	Brand IQ, LLC	Promo Universal, LLC	Carisma Print & Design, LLC
		Houston, TX	Oshkosh, WI	Schaumburg, IL	Brownsville, TX	Webster, TX	Corpus Christi, TX	Brownsville, TX
1	Polo Shirts NIKE Size S-XL	\$28.00	\$35.96	\$40.48	\$36.00	\$34.00	\$52.00	\$81.00
2	Polo Shirts Ash City S-XL	\$14.00	\$13.05	\$15.26	\$8.00	\$19.99	\$29.00	\$40.00
3	Shirts Fruit of the Loom S-XL	\$5.50	\$6.20	No Bid	\$7.20	\$4.25	\$5.50	\$15.00
4	Caps	\$7.50	\$5.98	\$5.74	\$6.40	\$8.00	No Bid	\$18.00
5	Umbrella w/single tone	\$12.38	\$8.09	\$10.04	\$12.00	\$15.00	\$11.50	\$23.00
6	Backpack	\$3.06	\$2.47	\$2.69	\$3.19	\$2.35	\$3.25	\$2.75
7	Plastic bags	\$0.56	\$0.40	\$.89	\$0.08	\$0.90	\$.85	\$0.75
8	Adhesive phone wallets	\$1.27	\$1.25	\$.95	\$3.99	\$0.65	\$1.50	\$1.75
9	Orange lanyard	\$1.78	\$1.79	\$1.51	\$3.19	\$1.10	\$1.70	\$1.60
10	Pens	\$0.38	\$0.26	\$0.45	\$1.03	\$0.30	\$0.45	\$0.80
	Average Price Promotional Item	7.44	7.54	7.80	8.11	8.65	10.58	18.47
11	Banner 3x8 vinyl	\$144.00	\$76.50	\$57.95	\$96.00	No Bid	\$60.00	\$85.00
12	Posters 24x36, one sided	\$13.50	No Bid	\$9.95	\$12.00	No Bid	\$15.00	\$95.04
13	Brochure 8.5x11	\$0.93	No Bid	\$0.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.54	\$3.56
	Average Price Printing Solutions	17.91	25.50	22.90	14.55	No Bid	25.18	28.33
	Score	14.53	19.79	9.72	13.25	12.51	14.37	8.54

Note: The order of appearance is from lowest to highest respondent based on averaged price for some of the most common purchased items.

